
From: Emad Hanna < 
Sent: Tuesday, January 18, 2011 5:12 PM 
To: jeffrey epstein 
Subject: RE: Tuition Assistance 

Jeffrey, 

Thank you so much for this I really appreciate your assistance mvaeducation means the world to me. 

Emad Hanna 

Project Controller 

HBRK Associates 

From: jeffrey epstein Imailtoleeyacation@gmail.com] 
Sent: Tuesday, January 18, 2011 8:11 AM 
To: Emad Hanna 
Subject: Re: Tuition Assistance 
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Ok 

Sorry for all the typos .Sent from my iPhone 

On Jan 17, 2011, at 11:15 PM, "Emad Hanna" 
wrote: 

Jeffrey, 

Sorry to bother you about this but the tuition is due by this Friday and I don't have the resources to make this 
happen so I really need your help with this. 

Thank you 

Emad Hanna 

Project Controller 

HBRK Associates 

From: Emad Hanna 
Sent: Thursday, January 13, 2011 10:55 AM 
To: 'Jeffrey Epstein' 
Subject: Tuition Assistance 
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Jeffrey, 

May I please have your assistance with my tuition in the amount of $ 13,486 per the attached that is due 
next Friday the 21st. 

Thank you 

Emad Hanna 

Project Controller 

HBRK Associates 

2011 Spring.pdf> 
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