From: Richard Kahn |

Sent: Thursday, March 19, 2015 2:48 AM

To: Jeffrey Epstein

Cc: Larry Visoski

Subject: Fwd: Resolve of outstanding balances due

Attached is Eric reaction to my propos=I| of 51,000 to settle outstanding. Please advise.
Sent from my=iPhone

Begin forwarded message:

From: Eric Roth
Date: March 18, 2015 at 11:17:22 AM M=T

Subject: Resolve of outstandin= balances due
Good afternoon Richard,
| have scrutinized each and every item on the summary i=voice which identifies an outstanding balance of $76,230.=/p>
These costs were already discounted due to my relationship with Jeffrey.

Although for the life of me | do understand why he want= to knock down the price, but as much as | care for Jeffrey,
there are stil= things about him | just can’t explain — this being one of them.

As a small business, this is real money that has an imp=ct on my business and is long overdue. | believe that if | concede
to=taking TEN THOUSAND DOLLARS (510,000.00) off the outstanding balance due, that | am being far more than fair as |
would like=to get this resolved and put it past us.

Respectfully,
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Eric

ERIC H. ROTH | PRESIDENT

From: Eileen Craig

Sent: Wednesday, March 18, 2015 11:16 AM
To: Eric Roth

Subject: Summary for open items for JEGE

See attached

EILEEN CRAIG&nb=p; | ACCOUNTING

T v it com

<http://www.intljet.com> &=bsp; <http://www.twitter.com/fintljet> </=pan> <http://www.facebook.com/intljet>
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