
From: desiree cisneros < 
Sent: Friday, March 4, 201.111 
To: Myla Trestiza 
Subject: Re: Certificates 

Myla! 

Good Morning, 

That is fan=astic thank you so much! 

Have you been trying to reach my cell bec=use I lost my cell phone somewhere so I'm trying to get back my same 
n=mber today! 

Also, today I'm going to go=to my doctor to just check up because I have a visit him every 6 months to=make sure I'm all 
okay with tests and what not. I'm starting today=at 10am so I just want to wait back for my results just to make sure 
every=hing is alright with me! I will get my results Monday! So if I can start e=ther Tuesday or Wednesday that would be 
great! 

<=iV> 

I can't thank you enough! Very excited to start this=week! Please contact me through here as I am using my computer to 
check my=emails! 

Kind Regards, 
<=iv>Desiree Cisneros 

On Thursday, March 3, 2016, Myl= Trestiza > wrote: 

Hi Desiree, 

Well received.. You can st=rt on Monday @ 8 am Marigot Fort Louis.Give me a call so we can meet up at=the 
gate you might need a gate key to get in to the marina. Thanks 

Kind regards 
Myla 

Sent from my iPh=ne 

On Mar 3, 2016, at 12:43 PM, desiree cisneros wrote: . • 
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On Thursday, March 3, 2016, desiree cisneros wrote: 

Good mo=ning Myla, 

Attached are the certificates. This is how m= STCW and security awareness looks like and this is 
the official card cert=ficate. My ENG1 also is back to front the official certificate. 

=div> 

I remember explaining you that my Food and Hygiene is a=art of my whole degree that is 
Hospitality Management. 

Kind Regards, 
Desiree Cisneros 
On Thursday, March 3, 2016, Myla Trestiza <m1t91875@yahoo.com&g=; wrote: 

Hi Desiree, 

Please scan and send me the complete certificates Engl and STCW and Securit= 
awareness and food handling/ hygiene. 

Thank you 

Myla 

Sent from my iPhone 
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