
From: MY Te Manu 
Sent: Wednesday, March 16, 2016 4:06 PM 
To: Andrew Belcher 
Cc: Myla 
Subject: Re: USD Incendia card load 

Hi Andy, 

Well =oted, please arrange to mail the card to MY Te Manu via Shore Support =XM 

Best Regards 
Capt. Dave =ohnson & Crew 
www.yachttemanu.com 

Capt. Mobile: 
Boat Cell: =/span> =/span 

Good Morning Dave, 

Myla's card has been re-issued (so the =alance from the old card has been transferred automatically). Because 
=here is already a balance on the card it will not be activated until =ou confirm it has arrived, so the pin will be issued 
then as =ell. 

Best Regards, 
Andy 

Andy =elcher. 
Accounts Assistant 

From: MY Te Manu 
Sent: 11 March 2016 =2:04 
To: Andrew =elcher 
Subject: Re: USD Incendia card =oad 

Hi =ndrew 

Tks =r latest, please send the new card to Shore Support =XM 

Best =egards 
Capt. Dave =ohnson & Crew 
www.yachttemanu.com <http://www.yachttemanu.com/> 

Capt. Mobile: &=bsp; &nb=p; 
Boat Cell: &=bsp; &nb=p; <=pan class="Apple•converted•space' 
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Hello Dave, 

That's ok, we will have to issue Myla a new =ard so can you let me know where you would like us to send it and I 
=ill get that done for you. 

Best =egards, 
Andy 

Andy =elcher. 
Accounts =ssistant 

From: MY Te Manu 
Sent: 10 March 2016 =1:28 
To: Gail=Belcher 
Cc: Andrew Belcher; Allan =ilson; Myla 
Subject: Re: USD Incendia card =oad 

Hi =ail, Andy, 

Regret to inform you that Myla's New USD Incendia Card # 2345 =an not be found & appears to have been =ost 

If =ossible, please transfer funds from lost card to Capt. USD Card # 2404 =amp; issue a replacement card =sap 

Best Regards 
Capt. Dave Johnson & =rew 
www.yachttemanu.com <http://www.yachttemanu.com/> 
=div style="margin: 0cm 0cm 0.0001pt; font-size: 12pt; font-family: =Times New Roman', serif;"> 
Capt. Mobile: &=bsp; &nb=p; +=(1) 721 526 5778 
Boat Cell: &=bsp; &nb=p; <=span 

Hello Dave, 

I am emailing to confirm the card =oads as detailed in your message below have been completed. 

If =ou need anything else don't hesitate to ask. 

Best =egards, 
Andy 

Andy Belcher. 
Accounts =ssistant 
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 Original Message 
From: Dave Johnson 
Sent: 01 March 2016 =4:59 
To: Gail Belcher 
Cc: Allan Wilson 
Subject: USD Incendia =ard load 

Hi Gail 
I will be renewing my US passport in Miami =amp; will be away from my office for the next few days In 

preparation =or the owners Caribbean cruise please load funds onto the following USD =ncendia cards: 

Capt's card $8,000.00 USD 
Myla's card =4,000.00 USD 
Chefs card $4,000.00 USD 

Dave 

Sent =rom my =Phone 

<=div> 
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