
From: philip baker 
Sent: Sunday, June 23, 2019 9:49 AM 
To: Richard Kahn 
Cc: Myla Trestiza 
Subject: Re: Flights 

Hi Mr Kahn, 
Thank you for the reply. I was re-reading my mail and seems I made a =istake with the dates. Sunday is July 7 ( not July 6 
as I previously wrote= so Monday 8 would be when I could do the bank account, travelling to STT =uesday July 9. 
Sorry for the mix up. 
Phil Baker 

From: Richard Kahn 
Sent: Friday, 21 June 2019 1:49 AM 
To: philip baker 
Cc: MYLA TRESTIZA; Daphne Wallace 
Subject: Re: Flights 

all flights and timing is ok with us.. 
please let me know if you want me to pay for anything or if=you prefer to pay and we will reimburse.. 
thank you and looking forward to having you join.. 

Richard Kahn 

New York, NY 10022 
tel
fa 
cel 

On Jun 20, 2019, at 9:44 AM, philip baker wrote: 

Good day Mr Kahn, 
It's been a while since I talked to you but Myla has been keeping me update=. 
I applied for a new passport which I recieved yesterday. My old one was sti=l good for a year but I thought a new 

one would avoid any complications wi=h renewal at a possibly inconvenient time later. 
I have a flight tentatively reserved which would get me into Ft Lauderdale =n Saturday, July 5. I would then stay 

(and recover) with friends there Sun=ay July 6 and was hoping to open a bank account there (which I have done t=ere 
before) on Monday July 7. I know for sure I cannot do this in St Thomas as I tried at a previous tim=. 
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This would leave me open to travel to STT July 8. I have not booked anythin= from Florida to St Thomas as this 
would best be done from the US. </=iv> 

I would have to confirm the flight tomorrow as it is reserved 24 hours. 
I hope this looks ok to you. 

Regards, 
Phil Baker 
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