
From: Andrew Belcher < 
Sent: Frida , A ril 10, 2015 12:55 PM 
To: 
Subject: RE: Incendia card 

Hi Myla, 

=/o:p> 

Balance for=card ending 0197: $4,435.38 

=/o:p> 

Balance for=card ending 3779: $2,002.95 

=/o:p> 

Please let =e know if you need any more assistance. 

&nb=p; 

Best Regards,<=span> 

Andy 

<=p> 

Andy Belcher.<=span> 

Accounts Assistant</=:p> 

Wilson Yacht Management</=pan> 

http://www.wilsonyachtmanagement.com/ chttp://www.wil=onyachtmanagement.comh 

<=p> 

Phone: 

Fax: 

Efax: 

Cell: 

US Efax: 

Email: 

EFTA_R1_00157814 
EFTA01808569



<https://www.facebook.com/wilson.yachtmana=ement?ref=bookmarks> <=:p> 

CONFIDENTIALITY NOTICE: T=is email (including all attachments) is for the intended recipient only an= may contain 
confidential information, some of which my be privileged. Please be advised that any disclosure, copying, distr=bution 
or use of any part of the information contained is prohibited. = If you received this email in error, please destroy the 
original email an= its attachment and notify me immediately. Thank you 

<=p> 

&nb=p; 

&nb=p; 

<=p> 

From: MYLA TRESTIZA [=ailtol 
Sent: 10 April 2015 13:44 
To: Gail Belcher; MY Te Manu 
Subject: Incendia card 

Hi Gail , 

Pls check the balance of th= incendia cards ending 0197 and 3779 and funds if necessary. 

Thank you=/p> 

Myla 

Sent from Yahoo Mail for iPhone <https://yho.com/footer0> 

2 

EFTA_R1_00157815 
EFTA01808570


