"Lesley Groff" _ "Jeffrey Epstein” <jeevacation@gmail.com> FW:
Columbia Business School Tuition Payment for John O'Sullivan

Johnny called me again today on this and asked that | follow up
with youb&

B

From: nycjos

gnailtc:-:nycjc:s@aal_mm] Sent. Monday, February 07, 2011 12:15 PM To: Rich Kahn
c. Lesley Groff Subject: Fwd: Columbia Business School Tuition Payment for John

O'Sullivan

Dear
Rich,

Please

can you let me know what's happening re paying off my Columbia student debt.
Both the Duke and Duchess have asked what's happening but | don't have any
information to share with them.

Thanks
and best wishes,

John
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John O'Sullivan

ot g o com> Rich Katr < .cs/cy Grofr
Fwd: Columbia Business School Tuition Payment for John
ullivan

Dear Rich,

Please can | have anBupdate as to what's happening regarding paying off my
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Columbia student debt. | spoke with Columbia again today and they are awaiting your
call.

Thanks and best wishes,

John

----- Original —
From: nycjos

Sent. F1i

Subjéct: Columbia Business School Tuition Payment for John Q'Sullivan

Hi Rich,

Thank you for speaking to Leah Young in the Financial Aid Office at Columbia
Business School. | just spoke to Marilena Botoulas, the Director of the Financial Aid
Office,Band she is expecting your callBregarding settling my student account.

Marilena's contact details are:

Marilena Botoulas

Director of Financial Aid

Please let me know if there is anything that | can do to help speed things along.
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Thanks and best wishes,

John

John O'Sullivan
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