
To: Rich Kahn( 
From: Jeffrey Epstein 
Sent Mon 9/27/2010 6:36:24 PM 
Subject Re: FW: Invoice for Sound X 

pay it 

On Mon, Sep 27, 2010 at 7:28 PM, Rich Kahn ‹ > wrote: 

Attached is Sound X invoice for LSJ and Zorro totaling 8,808.46 

Brice approved however I wanted your approval before I pay? 

Please advise. 

Rich Kahn 

HBRK Associates Inc. 

301 East 66th Street, Suite 10F 

New York, NY 10065 

tel 

fax 

cell 

From: bricc gordon [maiIto 
Sent: Thursday. September .231.1.I M
To: Rich Kahn 
Cc: Emad Hanna 
Subject: Fwd: Invoice for Sound X 

hi there 

jeffrey requested trip dates, this was approved by me some time ago. 

any questions please let know 
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Brice 

 Forwarded messa e 
From: nick lambros 
Date: Thu, Sep 9, 2010 at 3:14 PM 
Subject: Invoice for Sound X 

■ To: ' 

Hey guys here is an Up to Date invoice for all past trips and Equipment can you please try 
to expedite payment for me please 

Nick Lambros 
Sound X 
360 w. Northwest Highway 
Office 

The information contained in this communication is 
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may 
constitute inside information, and is intended only for 
the use of the addressee. It is the property of 
Jeffrey Epstein 
Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this 
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited 
and may be unlawful. If you have received this 
communication in error, please notify us immediately by 
return e-mail or by e-mail to jee‘acationggmail com, and 
destroy this communication and all copies thereof, 
including all attachments. 
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