o cay kemey [

From: Jeevacation
Sent: Tue 5/4/2010 9:00:55 PM

Subject: Re: Desal Plant Material
[ did

Sent from my iPhone
On May 4, 2010, at 1:57 PM, "Gary Kerney" _wrm{::

Jeffrey,sorry to bother you
We have started to pour the building and need this material to continue making concrete.its in

the budget.
please give Emad the approval asap.| did'nt know this required your approval.

Gary

From: Emad Hanna _
Sent: Mon 5/3/2010 2:08 PM

To: Jeffrey Epstein

Cc: Gary Kemey

Subject: Desal Plant Material

Jeffrey,

Gary 1s secking approval for $ 40,140 for 200 tons of Stone, 200 tons of Colombian sand,
200 tons of manufactured sand for pick up this Wednesday.

And will need another 300 tons of each for next week and that cost is $ 60,210
So total approval is for $ 100,350
Thank you

Emad Hanna

Project Controller
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