
To: Rich Kahn( 
From: Jeevacatio 
Sent: Tue 6/15/2010 7:29:11 PM 
Subject: Re: Antilles School - Tuition Invoice 

Ok 

Sent from my iPhonc 

On Jun IS, 2010, at 3:09 PM, 

Please advise 

Rich Kahn 

HBRK Associates Inc. 

From: Cecile de Jongh 
Sent: Tuesday, June 15, 2010 : 
To: Rich Kahn 
Subject: Fw: Antilles School - Tuition Invoice 

Hi Rich, 

rote: 

This is the tuition bill for Antilles for 2010-2011. The amount stated is $15,900 
but I paid a $1,000 deposit so the balance due is $14,900.00 

Thanks, 

EFTA_R1_00182983 
EFTA01812755



Cecile 

EFTA_R1_00182984 

EFTA01812756


