To: George Reenslra[_

From: Jeffrey Epstein
Sent: Thur 4/29/2010 3:49:45 PM
Subject: Re:

details needed as to deposit payment schedule

On Thu, Apr 29, 2010 at 11:30 AM, George Reenstra _ wrote:

The Chinese customer is still interested but not focused. Sikorsky is in the process of setting up
some demo work, they feel they have some interest. | am turning over all the stones. What did you
think of my offshore idea, | think | can even make the deal a few hundred K sweeter to you. | think
your profit could be as | said 1m and | would wait till you earned that to get my cut. Your thoughts

George Reenstra

Aircraft Services Group Inc
300 Corporate Drive, Suite 2
Mahwah, NJ 07430

T/

Fax (201) 995-9504

Sent: Thursday, April 29, 2010 10:53 AM
To: George Reenstra
Subject:

where 15 the activity on 750 7
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The information contained in this communication is
confidential, may be attorney-chient privileged, may
constitute inside information, and is intended only for
the use of the addressee. It 1s the property of

Jeffrey Epstein

Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this
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communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited
and may be unlawful. If you have received this
communication in error, please notify us immediately by
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation(@gmail com, and
destroy this communication and all copies thereof,
mncluding all attachments.
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The information contained in this communication 1s
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may
constitute mside imformation, and 1s intended only for
the use of the addressee. It is the property of

Jeffrey Epstein

Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this
communication or any part thercof is strictly prohibited
and may be unlawful. If you have received this
communication in error, please notify us immediately by
return ¢-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation(@ gmail.com, and
destroy this communication and all copies thereof,
including all attachments.
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