
To: 
From: Jeevacation 
Sent: Tue 6/8/2010 9:04:12 PM 
Subject: Re: D contract 

Reenstra? 

Sent from my iPhonc 

On Jun 8, 2010, at 4:08 PM, wrote: 

Jeffrey and Darren, 
Howard just called me, he thinks Sikorsky will agree to terms and final price of 12,168M for the 
D, to include items that i requested to include the IJI interior, Satphone and chart holders, and 
3rd year warrenty, He said alot more people need to sign off on this price, should be final 
tomorrow 
thx 
Larry 
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