T eelia iein

From: Jeevacation
Sent: Mon 7/189/2010 6:25:51 PM
Subject: Re: account funding

Yes

Sent from my iPhone

On Jul 19, 2010, at 1:33 PM, "Bella chin"_ wrote:

Do I have your permission to transfer $1,000,000 from FTC JMorgan to JEE
JPMorgan operating account. Balance in the operating account is § 84 183,

Thank you,

Bella
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