To: Rich Kahn ([

From: Jeffrey Epstein
Sent: Tue 7/28/2009 2:10:35 PM
Subject: Re: FW: Invoice for Peggy Siegal

ask if you used the ticket or not

On Tue, Jul 28, 2009 at 10:00 AM, Rich Kahn <} N - o

Deanna called on behalf of Peggy and outstanding invoice.

Please advise.

Rich Kahn

HBRK Associates Inc.
PO Box 400

New York, NY 10150

! I

From: Deanna Romeo |m.‘ai|1n_
Sent: Wednesday, July 15, 2009 4:24 PM

To: Rich Kahn

Subject: Invoice for Peggy Siegal

Hey Rich,

I have attached an inveice for "PR services” for Peggy Siegal. It is for her trip on July 21st.
Please let me know il you have any questions or il you require any additional information.
Best regards,

Deanna M. Romeo
waggingtail entertainment limited
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Pegey Siegal Inc.
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