
To: Bella Klein 
From: Jeffrey Epstein 
Sent Fri 8/14/2009 4:27:13 PM 
Subject: Re: Martin Novak 

I 

couq 

On Fri, Aug 14, 2009 at 12:25 PM, Bella Klein wrote: 

Should I reimburse Martin Nowak ($151.79) from COUQ Foundation or JE personal? 

Thank you 

Bella 
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The information contained in this communication is 
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may 
constitute inside information, and is intended only for 
the use of the addressee. It is the property of 
Jeffrey Epstein 
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