
To: Emad Hanna 
From: Jeffrey Epstein 
Sent Fri 7/31/2009 7:55:23 PM 
Subject Re: LSJ Landscaping Architect 

I 

remindg me tucss 

On Fri, Jul 31, 2009 at 3:54 PM, Emad Hanna <O> wrote: 

Jeffrey, 

I received a payment request for landscape design fees in the amount of $ 5,545 signed off by 
Stephen Caplinger & Gary Kerney. 

Do I have your approval to process this payment? 

Thank you 

Emad Hanna 

Project Controller 

HBRK Associates 

PO Box 400 

New York, NY 10150 

Ph 

Fax 

EFTA_R1_00187209 
EFTA01815948


