
TO: ion nicola 
Cc: 
Fran: Jeffrey Epstein 
Sent Wed 8/11/2010 10:40:38 AM 
Subject.• Re: 

I will wait. 

On Wed, Aug 11, 2010 at 6:25 AM, ion nicola wrote: 

hi jeffrey, 
sorry i couldnt meet you last week, i just saw e-mail about meeting. I'm still in romania 
and i was countryside for a while and i didn't have mtemet access. 

anyway, i wanted to ask you a favor if you dont mind and if you are not in a rush with doing 
some rooms.., i need to stay somehow a little longer in romania, till begining of september. i 
have to deal with some family stuff...its like a religous thing, even ?m not into religion but my 
mother want me to be here at the end of the month because there will be seven years since my 
father died, and they have to open the grave..and its like a big thing..a lot of family will be 
here, my sisters are comming next week and my brother wil be here too. 

what do think, it is that posible? 

regarding to do the painting in the office at the island, ..you said it is very humid during the 
summer, so i dont know if its good to do the painting during the summer, it might influence 
the proces of drying of the colors...maybe it would be better do the painting when its less 
humid. 

somehow i thought you'll not going to hire me again because i didnt get paid for the last two 
months of work ( my invoice was. aprox. 11,000$) even i asked lesley, darren, rich kahn, i 
never got an answer..they said they going to check and they will let me know, but 
then..nothing. i didnt get even aprox 300$ i paid for materials and i sent to rich kahn as 
reimbursement expenses. 
sorry about telling you about that. 

thank you 
nicola 
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