
To: William Rile 
From: Jeffrey Epstein 
Sent: Thur 8/20/2009 10:40:20 PM 
Subject: Re: Epstein 

early next week „ sorry„ i have been swamped 

On Tuc, Aug I I, 2009 at 5:32 PM, William Riley > wrote: 

Darren, 

Any idea when we might expect payment for our June billing? 

Bill Riley 

Riley Kiraly 

mailing address 

5645 Coral Ridge Drive 

Box 391 

Coral Springs, FL 33076 

O 

F: office) 

F: (personal) 

C: 

www.rileykiraly.com 

This message (and any associated files) is intended only for the use of the individual or entity to which it is addressed and 
may contain information that is confidential, subject to the attorney/client privilege or any other privilege afforded it under 
applicable state and/or federal law. If you are not the Intended recipient you are hereby notified that any dissemination. 
copying or distribution of this message, or files associated with this message. Is strictly prohibited. if you have received this 
message in error, please notify us immediately by replying to the message and deleting it from your computer. 
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************* 

The information contained in this communication is 
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may 
constitute inside information, and is intended only for 
the use of the addressee. It is the property of 
Jeffrey Epstein 
Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this 
communication or any pan thereof is strictly prohibited 
and may be unlawful. If you have received this 
communication in error, please notify us immediately by 
return e-mail or by e-mail to jecvacation@gmail.com, and 
destroy this communication and all copies thereof, 
including all attachments. 
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