
To: Gary Kemey 
From: Jeffrey Epstein 
Sent Wed 10/7/2009 4:32:12 PM 
Subject Re: 

why wait until the 20th a 

On Wed, Oct 7, 2009 at 7:24 AM, Gary Kerney ‹ > wrote: 

now 

asst. superintendent $60k to 80k depends on experience. we interviewed a potential I like who is working 
for krass manning(our testing co.) 

4 skilled workers concrete/carpentry $20 to $25 /hr(consistent with our current skilled pay scale) found 2 
need 2 more. 

future 

subject to our meeting oct20. 

I am putting together a package for your review in advance of the meet. 

From: Jeffrey Epstein [mailtajeevacation@ornalcomi 
Sent: Mon 10/5/2009 6:03 PM 
To: Gary Kerney; Stephen Caplinger GMAIL 
Subject: 

i understand that we may need more people , ok. lets do it numbers ? time frame.?. 

*********************************************************** 

The information contained in this communication is 
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may 
constitute inside information, and is intended only for 
the use of the addressee. It is the property of 
Jeffrey Epstein 
Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this 
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited 
and may be unlawful. If you have received this 
communication in error, please notify us immediately by 
return e-mail or by e-mail to jecvacation@gmail.com, and 
destroy this communication and all copies thereof, 
including all attachments. 
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