To:

From: Jeffrey Epstein

Sent: Tue 9/15/2009 3:02:09 PM
Subject: Re: Boeing maintenance

yyes

On Tue, Sep 15, 2009 at 10:56 AM, -fi- wrote:

Jeffrey,

For your approval,

We are scheduled for Oct 26" input date for inspection:

Larry Morrison and myself have selected FlightStar in Jacksonville to complete the Heavy “C”
and Aux fuel tank 5TC installation that will complete the Boeing fuel system. | have included
two other bids for this maintenance as price comparison for base “C" check inspection,
squawks will be additional and quoted during inspection as they are found. | believe
FlightStar's knowledge and history of our aircraft is reflected in their price quote: (down time
4 weeks+ estimate)

-FlightStar: $299,302.00 (50% deposit up front only).

-Timco (Lake City Fl) $5406,115.00 (required full payment up front).

-Commercial Jet (Miami Fl) $579,398.,00 (full payment up front).

| w ould like your permission to wire $150,000.00 to Flight Star as input deposit?

Is this approved?
Thank you,,
Larry V.
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The information contained in this communication is
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may
constitute inside information, and is intended only for

the use of the addressee. It is the property of

Jeftrey Epstein

Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited
and may be unlawful. If you have received this
communication in error, please notify us immediately by
return e-mail or by ¢-mail to jeevacation(@gmail.com, and

destroy this communication and all copies thereof,
including all attachments.
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