
To: 
From: Jeffrey Epstein 
Sent: Thur 11/5/2009 11:07:14 PM 
Subject: Re: Sean's invoice 

yes 

On Thu, Nov 5, 2009 at I :21 PM, < > wrote: 

Jeffrey, 
do you approve of me paying $4.305.00 for Boeing advertisements that Sean has invoice me? 

Personal I feel that we should not pay the $13,957.70 Sean is asking for the Sale advertisements for the first 
Sikorsky he tried to sell. If it wasn't for me deciding to give it to George, we would have not sold it. 
please advise how much we should pay? or portion their of.? 

thank you, 
Larry 

The information contained in this communication is 
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may 
constitute inside information, and is intended only for 
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