To:

From: Jeffrey Epstein

Sent: Wed 12/2/2009 3:08:03 PM
Subject: Re: update

tell them lear from west palm 445 am. return 8 pm.. offer 15k go to 16

On Wed, Dec 2, 2009 at 9:47 AM, - wrote:

Jeffrey,

X -the use of the loaner audio panel did not work, even though same part number, it was physically wrong in
size to fit on our aircraft,

-Only hope is Duncan Avionics in Mebraska to fix it today and airline it to Florida by tonight, | do not feel good
about this option at this time since Airline flights from Linceln to PBI are few in the afternoon, if | use fedex
the part could arrive 9:30am Thursday, | could at least pick you up in NY Thursday night as last resort. ..if
part is repaired today...

-Option 1 NO Hawker upgrade available from Flight Options for December 3rd, only Beach Jet. |
still have this flight booked.

CHARTER OPTION's (| have on stand by)
option 2 Hawker 800 (Tommy Mortola's charter guy, we have used before is very good, He gave me
a price of $16,000 round trip in Hawker 800 West Palm to Teterboro

Option 3 West Wind Il,, Darren Rothell works for this charter company in Lauderdale, West Wind II.

This price is lowest, depart Fort Lauderdale Executive airport to Teterbore $13,262.70 round trip
SEE ATTACHMENT for PHOTO's Of WESTWIND. | could have this depart from West Palm Beach

also.

Option 4 Lear Jet 60 West Palm to TEB round trip $17,662.00 new paint and interior 2008. fyi.

all three are reputable companies.
please advise your preference?

thank you,,
Larry
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The information contained in this communication is
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may
constitute inside information, and is intended only for
the use of the addressee. It is the property of

Jeftrey Epstein

Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this
communication or any part thercof is strictly prohibited
and may be unlawful. If you have received this
communication in error, please notify us immediately by
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation(@ gmail.com, and
destroy this communication and all copies thereof,

EFTA_R1_00195127
EFTA01821813



including all attachments.
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