
To: Emad Hanna 
From: Jeffrey Epstein 
Sent Mon 1/11/2010 6:08:13 PM 
Subject Re: Fuel Tanks 

ok 

On Mon, Jan II, 2010 at 1:06 PM, Emad Hanna wrote: 

Jeffrey, 

I understand that you have approved the payment of $ 111,455.84 for the Mechanical Building 
Fuel Tanks. 

I wanted you to be aware they are requiring the full payment before they make delivery, which 
not how we normally do things but Rowles tells me it was part of the contract.. 

We will go ahead and process this wire if you're ok with this. 

Thank you 

Emad Hanna 

Project Controller 

HBRK Associates 

PO Box 400 

New York, NY 10150 
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************* 

The information contained in this communication is 
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may 
constitute inside information, and is intended only for 
the use of the addressee. It is the property of 
Jeffrey Epstein 
Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this 
communication or any pan thereof is strictly prohibited 
and may be unlawful. If you have received this 
communication in error, please notify us immediately by 
return e-mail or by e-mail to jecvacation@gmail.com, and 
destroy this communication and all copies thereof, 
including all attachments. 
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