
To: Brice Gordon 
Cc: Emad Hanna 

From: Jeffrey Epstein 
Sent Thur 12/24/2009 5:37:18 PM 
Subject: Re: Zorro fountain 

ok 

On Wed, Dec 23, 2009 at 11:03 AM, Brice Gordon wrote: 

Both gary and jee approved this amount along with the stoops and outside chess set fountain 
refurb 

Verbal 
Along with the approach 
In fact the amount was approve a year ago but I reconfirmed with JEE 
To be on the safe side 
Do what ever you both wish to do 
Your call as JEE would say 
Thx 

-----Original Message 
From: Emad Hanna 
To: Brice Gordon 
Sent: Wed Dec 23 10:54:29 2009 
Subject: RE: Zorro fountain 

Brice, 

We're looking to get approval on the amount and there was no such approval from anyone in 
regards to the dollar amounts. 

Emad Hanna 
Project Controller 
HBRK Associates 
PO Box 400 
New York NY 10150 
Ph 
Fax 

 Original Message 
From: Brice Gordon 
Sent: Wednesday, December 23, 2009 10:47 AM 
To: Emad Hanna 
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Subject: Re: Zorro fountain 

So JEE and Gary both approve and then JEE has to approve again 
I will speak JEE next time I see him 
Thx 

 Original Message 
From: Emad Hanna 
To: Brice Gordon 
Sent: Wed Dec 23 10:05:37 2009 
Subject: RE: Zorro fountain 

Brice, 

The payment for the $ 13,087.20 has not been wired as of yet. 

I received this request just 2 days ago and Rich requires JE's approval on this since it is a large 
sum. 

I will e mail JE for approval 

Emad Hanna 
Project Controller 
HBRK Associates 
PO Box 400 
New York, NY 10150 
Ph 
Fax 

 Original Message 
From: Brice Gordon 
Sent: Wednesday, December 23, 2009 6:46 AM 
To: Emad Hanna 
Subject: Re: Zorro fountain 

The most recent one 

On 12/22/09 7:54 PM, "Emad Hanna" wrote: 

> Brice, 

> Are you referring to the $ 2,589 payment or the most recent one you 
> submitted for $ 13k 

> Emad Hanna 
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> Project Controller 
> HBRK Associates 
> PO Box 400 
> New York, NY 10150 
> Ph 
> Fax 

> Original Message 
> From: Brice Gordon 
> Sent: Tuesday, December 22, 2009 5:37 PM 
> To: Emad Hanna 
> Cc: Gary Kerney 
> Subject: Zorro fountain 

> Emad 
> Has the payment to 3 bb's been processed for the first stage of the 
> fountain, if not please explain. 
> Thx Brice 

The information contained in this communication is 
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may 
constitute inside information, and is intended only for 
the use of the addressee. It is the property of 
Jeffrey Epstein 
Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this 
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited 
and may be unlawful. If you have received this 
communication in error, please notify us immediately by 
return e-mail or by c-mail to jeevacation@gmail.com, and 
destroy this communication and all copies thereof, 
including all attachments. 
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