To: Gary Kermey NN
From: Jeffrey Epstein
Sent: Fri 1/29/2010 2:30:34 PM

Subject: Re: meguire

lets talk about it

On Fri, Jan 29, 2010 at 9:22 AM, Gary Kerney — wrote:

On sept 20 | signed a work order for a estimate of $53,500( not a fixed price) for the scope of work to revise

the scaled down mech. building plans.

While the revisions were in process we have had them do additional work,and have gone over the estimate

by §$7,767.50 and Rich and Darren needs your approval.

| know you don’t like open contracts but in this instance we have to have this Kind of a relationship. | need
their services to approve shop drawings,value engendering ideas thru the completion of work. My guess is

we will spend another $35 to $40,000 over the next 8 mos.

| will not use them any more than necessary.

| need you to give me authority to continue to use them and approve their bills.

Gary
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Jeffrey Epstein
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