
To: 
Cc: Ruch Kah 
From: Jeffrey Epstein 
Sent Mon 3/1/2010 5:21:05 PM 
Subject Re: quite wing Invoice 

ok 

On Mon, Mar 1, 2010 at 11:55 AM, a wrote: 

Jeffrey, 
I would like your approval for Rich Kahn to wire final payment to Quite Wing for their support during the fuel 
tank installation process? This was part of the contract agreement.. it was our discretion to have their 
representative on sight during the wiring and installation of the fuel tank STC... 
$20,000 

I told quite wing I needed to review their final invoice before sending this payment, original invoice was 
$31,348.56 and I negotiated the final payment to be $23,175.00,„I already paid $3,175 via American 
Express card on Friday night so they would fedex the AFM,,,,I gave them my word I would have their final 
payment on Monday, so they released the aircraft to me for our flight on Saturday. 

thank you, 
Larry 

*********************************************************** 

The information contained in this communication is 
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may 
constitute inside information, and is intended only for 
the use of the addressee. It is the property of 
Jeffrey Epstein 
Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this 
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited 
and may be unlawful. If you have received this 
communication in error, please notify us immediately by 
return e-mail or by e-mail to jecvacation@gmail.com, and 
destroy this communication and all copies thereof, 
including all attachments. 
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