
To: Lesley Gro 
Cc: Rich Kahn( 
Fran: Jeffrey Epstein 
Sent Tue 4/13/2010 3:03:53 PM 
Subject Re: Robert Couturier 

the money should be sent 50k.. the agreement needs some work 30% is agreed 

On The, Apr 13, 2010 at 11:02 AM, Lesley Groff •=z > wrote: 

Sally Ann from Robert Couturier's office called to confirm you received the contract via email 
she sent to you via email. She said since Robert has already begun some work, the retainer fee 
really needs to be paid soon! 

If you have any questions re the contract or retainer, you may call her at 

Her email address is: 

*********************************************************** 

The information contained in this communication is 
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may 
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