To:
From: Jeffrey Epstein
Sent: Mon 3/22/2010 5:15:51 PM

Subject: Re: forward on to george and mark

as you and i agreed , transparency is lacking, the brokers- george and mike are your reps |, not
mine, you should be able to deal with them , and hopefully arrange the transaction.. I am willing
to go to net numbers if there is some benefit to you.. In exchange for 300k paid to me |, I will get
a new heli with a six million down payment and all the benefits that you and [ have agreed.

On Mon, Mar 22, 2010 at 1:06 PM, Jeffrey Epstein <jeevacation@gmail.com> wrote:

Im sorry , 1 suggested 6 million at execution.. and it depends on a 300 k net spread for the
current 750. which in your example seperate rom the 6 milhion vs ten, would mean a net price
tomeof 12, 6 ..

On Mon, Mar 22, 2010 at 12:28 PM, <} |GGG ot

from Marc Poland to Jeffrey:

—————————— Forwarded message ----------

From: " Pulandl Marc B SIK” _

To: < >
Date: Mon, 22 Mar 2010 12:17:27 -0400
Subject: RE: forward on to george and mark

To offer a bit more clarity on what seems like a deal we can close, subject to Jeffrey’s acceptance;

e MNew aircrall to match configuration of 750 in all regards, excepl cosmetics.
o  Customer retains flexibility to specify new colors and interior materials,

. Baseline delivery will be June or July {July latest in contract, but I think we can pull in to June), final
delivery in March, 2010,

o Priceis as follows:
> Calculated price $12,750,000
o Less early-pymit discount  ($250,000)
o Less “entitlements’ (1) (B 1900000

o NET PRICE 512,310,000
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¢  Payment on contract execution is $10,463,500. This is the 85%, exactly as described on 3/18. No
payment at baseline delivery, and balance on final delivery of completion services.

+« In the event of a contract being signed for the 76D prior to June 30, 20010, an adjustment will be made to

the above price; reducing the ‘“NET PRICE' and the balance due on final delivery by 100,000, This will
yield the ~512.2M mentioned by Jeffrey.

Please confirm that the above is acceptable, following which we will swiftly adapt a contract to fit this
and provide it to Darren for his review,

NOTES

(1) presumes that “entitlements” purchased on 750 will not go to new buyer, but will be transferred to this new
ship. This includes the AAG charter time, additional training, and third year of warranty. We'll have to sort
this out contractually with a series of short documents, bt [ suggest we keep the current contract “clean’ in
this regard

- Services Assignment Agreement ; Extracts and assigns to new owner of 750 those entitlements contained
in our standard offering

- Termination Agreement : Terminates all obligations of the 750 sales agreement

- Services Agreement | Obligates Sikorsky 1o buyer for the additional entitlements, now associated with a
new purchase,

Any gquestions, please do not hesitate 1o contact me,

Thank you.

Marc B. Poland
Commercial Director

Sikorsky Global Helicopiers
tel
fa

From: [mailto: LVIETiraol.com]

Sent; Monday, March 22 20010 11:43 AM
To: [N, 7o', Marc B SIK

Subject: Fwd: forward on to george and mark

EFTA_R1_00199892
EFTA01825425



Jeffrey ask me to Forward this to you Marc,
thanks,

Larry
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The information contained in this communication is
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may
constitute inside information, and is intended only for
the use of the addressee. It is the property of

Jeffrey Epsten

Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this
communication or any part thercof is strictly prohibited
and may be unlawful. If you have received this
communication in error, please notify us immediately by
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation(@gmail.com, and
destroy this communication and all copies thereof,
including all attachments.

The mformation contained in this communication 1s
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may
constitute inside information, and is intended only for
the use of the addressee. It is the property of

Jeffrey Epstein

Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this
communication or any part therecof is strictly prohibited
and may be unlawful. If you have received this
communication in error, please notify us immediately by
return ¢-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation(@ gmail com, and
destroy this communication and all copies thereof,
including all attachments.
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