
To: Gary Kemey 
From: Jeffrey Epstein 
Sent Fri 2/26/2010 3:26:40 PM 
Subject Re: Stephen 

Im ok with that in general gary, but it is relly not fair that since June i have asked for things , msi 
was paid, nothing has been built. i not only gave him a job, as per Jerry , even though he was to be 
paid only 100 k, if he stayed at landmark, I have been more than fair. i have no master plan, no 
irrigation , no superviosr, no road layout , no overlays. i want to be fair, rich how much have we 
paid since inception including msi 

On Fri, Feb 26, 2010 at 10:19 AM, Gary Kerney wrote: 

Jeffrey 

Rich told me that you paid Landmark for me only.Stephen is due to come in next week.lf he is not going to 
be paid he should not come and i have a problem with how we proceed with CZM and the site world think 
we should pay him thru march which should get us thru the submittal then let him go.Lets talk. 

Gary 
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