From: Jeffrey Epstein
Sent: Thur 4/30/2009 3:56:06 PM
Subject: Re: Dr. Thomas J. Magnani

april 29 isyesterday,, i don't know who that is?
On Thu, Apr 30, 2009 at 11:41 AM, Bella Klein _ wrote:

Hi Jeffrey,

| have an invoice for Andrea visit Dr. Magnani on 4/29 for $875. Is the payment authorized?

Thank you

Bella
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