
To: 
From: e ey ps ein 
Sent Thur 5/7/2009 4:35:22 PM 
Subject Re: 

no problem„ i will help... just make sure you get it fixed„ I will call the dentist on monday 

On Thu, May 7, 2009 at 11:28 AM, •:a wrote: 

I told them not to send you the bill anymore though 1 can't afford to pay it now!so far is 
1250$. And I have to go back again on monday again coz is really bad what I have there and 
now I'm rea ed! 

There is a girl, lithat says hello from drMs office! 

Sent via BlackBerry from T-Mobile 

From: Jeffrey Epstein 
Dat 
To: 
Subject: 

I have no details „ what help would you like„ how much money do you need please 
coordinate travel plans with  ?m not sure this weekend works.. 
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