
To: 
From: 
Sent 
Subject: Re: Ciaol 

e'rev os em 
Thur 6/11/2009 7:07:18 PM 

a daily rate was ever agreed nor was a coorespnding weekly rate.. what do you think is fair , 
jeffrey would like to resolve this asap. please submit a total amount that you believe is 
appropriate under the circumstances. thank you 

On Thu, Jun 11, 2009 at 3:01 PM, 

Begin forwarded message: 

From: 
Date: June II 2009 1:50:00 PM EDT 
To: 
Subject: FW: Ciao! 

wrote: 

Hi-
I was paid $2500 of $4000 due from this period. Here is our correspondance on 
this... 

Then I worked from Wednesday, June 3rd - Wednesday, June 10th - 1/2 day with Sunday 
off. So, 6.5 days $3250.00. 

Any questions or difference in opinions please feel free to contact me and clarify. 

I thank you for your assistance. 

Sincerely, 

From 
To 
Subject: RE: Ciao! 
Date: Fri, 29 May 2009 09:02:38 -0400 

Good Morning! 

Yes, it i
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Fro 
To: 
Subject: Re: Ciao 
Date: Thu, 28 May 2009 17:04:23 -0400 

Great, thanks. 
Do you know the routing number for your bank and I can have money wired to your 

account? 

On May 27, 2009, at 9:36 Pawrote: 

Ciao 

Hey! I am going tomorrow to the Dominican Republic with. 

I am not really sure how everything works and am quite flexible. I hope I am 
coming back here after to work with Jeffrey: ) 

I kept track of when I came n to give an idea of what I did (maybe every so 
often he'd like to know, or not). : ) I am guessing tomorrow is 
about the same...I would be happy to call Wed May 20 & 
tomorrow half days. It is important for me also that Jeffrey is 
happy and agree's. : ) 

Wed. May 20th - evening foot massage for Jeffrey, teach 

Thurs. May 21 - work w/Jeffrey 3x's, teach 

Fri. May 22 - Jeffrey 7:15 - 10:30ish, 6:30-9 

Sat. May 23 - Jeffrey 7:15 - 10:30,E2ish hrs 

Sun. May 24 - Joe Pagano 3ish hours 

Mon. May 25 - Jeffrey 3 hrs., Jo 2-3 hrs, 1 1/2ish 

Tues. May 26 - Jeffrey 8-11AM, Jo 1 1/2ish hrs 

Wed. May 27 - Jeffrey 7:30 - 10, Jo evening 1 1/4 hrs. 

Thurs. May 28 - Jeffrey 7:30 - 10 

s back 

It would be helpful for me to get paid at least partial as it is near the end of 
the month and some things are coming due. Would it be 
possible to have that put in my account? 
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My bank is Washington Mutual and account I know there is 
one right nears place. (A Washington Mutual, that is.) ; ) 

I do hope you had a great day, you are really wonderful and I would love to 
see you happy! ; ) 

Thanks for everything you do! 

See you in the morning! 

: ) 

Insert movie times and more without leaving Hotmail®. See how. 

Windows LiveTm: Keep your life in sync. Check it out. 

Insert movie times and more without leaving Hotmail®. See how 
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