
To: Rich Kahn 
From: Jeffrey Epstein 
Sent Thur 5/14/2009 4:08:22 PM 
Subject: Re: FW: Invoices 

ok 

On Thu, May 14, 2009 at 11:57 AM, Rich Kahn •r > wrote: 

George has submitted additional invoices for 2008 in the amount of 125,000. Is this ok to pay? 

Rich Kahn 

HBRK Associates Inc. 

From: imailto 
Sent: Thursday, May 14, 2009 11:37 AM 
To: Rich Kahn 
Subject: Invoices 

Rich: 

Per our conversation. 

Regards, 

George 

EFTA_R1_00203316 
EFTA01827984



US Treasury Department Circular 230 requires that we inform you that any federal tax advice 
contained in this communication (including attachments) is not intended or written to be used 
and cannot be used, for the purpose of (i) avoiding penalties under the Internal Revenue Code 
or (ii) promoting, marketing or recommending to another party any transactions or matter 
addressed herein. 
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