To: Deanna Romeo| |

From: Jeffrey Epstein
Sent: Tue 5/M12/2009 1:15:52 PM
Subject: Re: Cannes clarification

peggy should speak to me

On Tue, May 12, 2009 at 8:29 AM, Deanna Romeo --’_'.-*- wrote:

Jefirey,

I just wanted to clarify that the S10,000 will be covering Pegoy's transportation {i.e., cars at night) as well as her meals
and other vanous expenses.

My apologies for not making that clear in my first e-mail.
Many thanks!

Deanna M. Romeo

waggingtail entertainment limited
Pegoy Siegal Inc.

S0 Broadway, Suite 400

New York, NY 10003

T30 Lexington Avenue, 5th Floor
New York, NY 10022
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