To.  Rion Kann

From: Jeevacation
Sent: Mon 12/6/2010 6:54:04 PM
Subject: Re: Deposit for LJS project

Ok

Sorry for all the typos .Sent from my iPhone

On Dec 6, 2010, at 1:46 PM, "Rich Kahn" _, wrote:

Please advise as Nick wants 75% deposit

Rich Kahn
HBRE Associates Inc.
381 East eeth Street, Suite 18F

New York, NY 18865

tel [
fax [
cell [N

From: nick lambros [mailto:nlambros@gmail .com]
Sent: Monday, December 06, 2010 11:58 AM
To: Rich Kahn
Subject: Deposit for LIS project

Hello Rich, got JE's email for you to send me $90k but need 75% of the Total as of now 1s
$181,241.80 can you please make the adjustment. On the contract it actually states
80%.

Also how do you intend to pay? Check or wire ? I can get you routing info so we can get
funds today and start ordering
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Thanks Mick

Nick Lambros

Sound X

360 w. Northwest Highway
Office
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