
To: Rich Kahn 
From: Jeffrey Epstein 
Sent Fri lir 2:41:30 PM 
Subject Re: 

yes 

On Fri, Jul 10, 2009 at 10:20 AM, Rich Kahn < > wrote: 

Last night brought in reimbursements for FSF in the amount of $671.09 and JEE 
personal in the amount of $645.43. 

has approved these reimbursements. Do I have your permission to pay her? 

Rich Kahn 

HBRK Associates Inc. 

PO Box 400 

New York, NY 10150 

tel 

fax 

cell 
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