
To: Al seckel 
Cc: Jeffrey EpsteinBeevacation@gmailicom] 
From: mike keesling 
Sent: Sat 12/11/2010 10:41:38 PM 
Subject: Re: Accounting on website 

what's below is correct, sorry for any confusion. 

Al seckel wrote: 

That's not true. I am cc'ing mike on this. He can verify below. 

From: Jeffrey Epstein <ieevacationPornail.com> 
To: Al seckel 
Sent: Sat, December 11, 2010 2:33:07 PM 
Subject: Re: Accounting on website 

he said he got the last two 10 k and a couple of thousand before. sorry , it doesn't add 
up, 

On Sat, Dec 11, 2010 at 4:50 PM, Al seckel wrote: 

Exactly (not changed or modified in any way) from what I sent you 
before, and then, just add on the three payments you made directly to 
Mike. 

10K 
10K 
2.5K 

That comes to a total average of 10K month. Mike's monthly fee for 
himself was $7500/month (which was for the first two months), and he 
took an additional 5K to do the initial set up. I did not pay him all at once 
up front, because that is not how I do business. When they have shown 
me that they can do the work and get results, then, I pay, which is what I 
did. I also got a substantial discount off his standard price for cash, which 
is what happens with most of the people I was working with. I was trying 
to keep costs down not the opposite. There was the additional monies for 
the hackers and Stephanie. I ended up having them all do far more work 
as favors. 

There is absolutely nothing in here for me other than helping out a friend 
who helped us. That was it. 
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************* 

The information contained in this communication is 
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may 
constitute inside information, and is intended only for 
the use of the addressee. It is the property of 
Jeffrey Epstein 
Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this 
communication or any pan thereof is strictly prohibited 
and may be unlawful. If you have received this 
communication in error, please notify us immediately by 
return e-mail or by e-mail to jecvacation@gmail.com, and 
destroy this communication and all copies thereof, 
including all attachments. 
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