To: bgordon.lsj contac

Cc: jeevacation@gmail com|jeevacation@gmail .com)
From: Bella Klein

Sent: Thur 12/9/2010 7:21:15 PM

Subject: RE: Zorro Time Wamer

To compensate one time installation fee for T1 $760 we will receive free service (credit of 5433) for the
first month on land lines bill.

Thank you,

Bella

From: brice gordon [mailto

Sent: Thursday, December 09, 2010 12:40 PM
To: Bella Klein

Cc: jeevacation@gmail.com

Subject: Zorro Time Warner

FYI

attached are new agreements for Data and Telecom for Zorro. Can you please review and would
highly recommend that you forward on our new IT guy for his review.

please note this to match existing bandwidth, if there is to be a change to greater bandwidth now
would be the time to negotiate

Any questions or concerns please contact me

Brice
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