
To: jeevacation@gmail.com[jeevacation@gmail.com] 
From: The Duke 
Sent: Fri 12/17/2010 1:14:41 PM 
Subject: Re: Fw: JOS 

I have passed this to Amanda and she will be in direct email with you. 
She is my eyes and ears and has done the negotiations with all the other creditors. She is tough! 
A 

From: Jeffrey Epstein <jeevacation@gmail.com> 
To: The Duke 
Sent: Fri Dec 17 13:06:26 2010 
Subject: Re: Fw: JOS 

john said he owed 60k to columbia university„ do you have a columbia university invoice for that 
amount? 

On Fri, Dec 17, 2010 at 7:56 AM, The Duke wrote: 

Here it is. 
A 

From: Amanda Thirsk 
To: The Duke 
Sent: Fri Dec 17 12:47:31 2010 
Subject: JOS 

Sir 

The total amount claimed is $126,721 so the maximum offer if you accept 100% of the claim would be 
$31,680. 

Within this figure we had deducted some $31K of sHartmoor expenses... and the Columbia late fees 
amount to $3,743. 

Full schedule attached. 

Hope this is what you needed. 
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Regards 

Amanda 

******************** ******************* ***** *************** 

The information contained in this communication is 
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may 
constitute inside information, and is intended only for 
the use of the addressee. It is the property of 
Jeffrey Epstein 
Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this 
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited 
and may be unlawful. If you have received this 
communication in error, please notify us immediately by 
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation(Thgmail.com, and 
destroy this communication and all copies thereof, 
including all attachments. 
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