
To: Rich Kahn 
From: Jeffrey Epstein 
Sent Mon 12/20/2010 6:39:56 PM 
Subject: Re: Peggy Siegel 

adn christmans 09??? 

On Mon, Dec 20, 2010 at 1:39 PM, Rich Kahn ‹ > wrote: 

Paid 25,000 3/19/2010 — from JEE 

Paid 10,500 9/16/2010 — from HBRK 

Total Paid 35,500 

Rich Kahn 

HBRK Associates Inc. 

New York, NY 10065 

tel 

fax 

cell 

The information contained in this communication is 
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may 
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Jeffrey Epstein 
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destroy this communication and all copies thereof, 
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