
To: Jeffrey Epsteinfleevacationagmail.comj 
From: Gary Kemey 
Sent Thur 12/9/2010 10:16:11 PM 
Subject: RE: FW: Flagpole Pool Proposal 

will find out now 

From: Jeffrey Epstein [malltoleevacatIonegmall.com] 
Sent: Thu 12/9/2010 5:01 PM 
To: Gary Kerney 
Subject: Fwd: FW: Flagpole Pool Proposal 

do they have pool potpie on staff 

 Forwarded message 
From: Rich Kahn <
Date: Thu, Dec 9, 2010 at 4:52 PM 
Subject: FW: Flagpole Pool Proposal 
To: Jeffrey Epstein leevacation@gmail.com>

Is this ok to pay? 

Have you approved scope of work? 

Rich Kahn 

HBRK Associates Inc. 

301 East 66th Street, Suite 10F 

New York, NY 10065 

tel 

fax 

cell 

From: Gary Kerney Imailto 
Sent: Thursday, December 09, 2010 4:47 PM 
To: Rich Kahn 
Cc: Jeffrey Epstein 
Subject: FW: Flagpole Pool Proposal 
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Rich 

I will sign the proposal,Please pay the $7,500 invoice for the retainer. 

Gary 

From: Warwick Wickman [mailto: 
Safi: Thu 12/9/2010 12:51 PM 
To: Gary Kerney 
Cc: Rich Kahn; Zattia Mitchell; Tom Sze; Bryan Oakes 
Subject: Flagpole Pool Proposal 

Gary, 

Attached please find our proposal for conceptual design services for the "flagpole pool". 

Thanks, 

Warwick 

Warwick Wicksman, AIA 
Princi al 

Gensler 
2500 Broadway 
Suite 300 
Santa Monica, California 90404 
USA 

Click here to view Gensler's 2010 Annual Report. 

The information contained in this communication is 
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may 
constitute inside information, and is intended only for 
the use of the addressee. It is the property of 
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Jeffrey Epstein 
Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this 
communication or any pan thereof is strictly prohibited 
and may be unlawful. If you have received this 
communication in error, please notify us immediately by 
return e-mail or by e-mail to ieevacation@gmail.com, and 
destroy this communication and all copies thereof, 
including all attachments. 
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