To: Jeffrey Epstein[ieevacation@gmail.com)

From:
Sent: Mon 12/27/2010 5:24:06 PM
Subject: Re:

We did, for a few months in advance, | will ask both of them now when it's time to pay again

From: Jeffrey Epstein <jeevacation@gmail.com>
To:

Sent: Mon, December 27, 2010 8:05:59 AM
Subject:

i don't remenber if we paid for school for- Dr-?

The mformation contained in this communication is
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may
constitute mside information, and 1s intended only for
the use of the addressee. It is the property of
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Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this
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