To: Gary Keme
Cc: Rich Kahn

From: Jeffrey Epstein
Sent: Tue 2/1/2011 2:43:29 PM
Subject: Re: shutters

no approved

On Tue, Feb 1, 2011 at 9:42 AM, Gary Kerney _ wrote:

Jeffrey

Rich is holding the deposit to Accent windows order for the shutters on cottages and kitchen of $21,295
| showed you the bid and you approved it 1/13/11

did you change your mind?

if nat should we add shutters for the doors in the master bedroom foyer 7
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The information contained in this communication is
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may
constitute inside information, and is intended only for
the use of the addressee. It is the property of

Jeffrey Epstein

Unauthorized use, disclosure or copymng of this
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited
and may be unlawful. If you have received this
communication in error, please notify us immediately by
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation(@gmail.com, and
destroy this communication and all copies thereof,
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved
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