
To: 
From: Jeffrey Epstein 
Sent: Wed 1/26/2011 9:36:05 PM 
Subject: Re: 

no 

On Wed, Jan 26, 2011 at 10:32 PM, wrote: 

Jeffrey i didn't ask you ,do i have to pay to Fred?! didn't even ask how much his work will 
cost?.. 

Sent from my iPad 

On 25 Jan 2011, at 10:00, jeffrcy cpstein leevacation@gmail.com> wrote: 

> Call and see dr victor re breasts 

> Sony for all the typos Sent from my iPhone 
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