From: Jeffrey Epstei
Sent: Tue 1/11/2011 8:01:19 PM
Subject: Re: LSJ Wire

VES
On Tue, Jan 11, 2011 at 12:32 PM, Emad Hannsz :_ wrote:

Jeftrey

Attached is a wire request in the amount 0f $ 28 189.05 for Air conditioning material and
labor for the mamn house renovations that 1s within the budget line

Thank you

Emad Hanna

Project Controller

HBRK Associates

181 East eeth 5t

Suite 18F

New York, NY 18865

Cell (340) 642-8763

LS] Office (348) 775-8127

5t. Thomas Office (348) 775-2525
NY Office (846) Be2-4815

Fax (646) 358-8221
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The information contammed m this commumcation 15
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may
constitute inside information, and is intended only for
the use of the addressee. It is the property of

Jeftrey Epstein

Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited
and may be unlawful. If you have received this
communication in error, please notify us immediately by
return ¢-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation(@gmail.com, and
destroy this communication and all copies thereof,
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved
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