To: Gary Kemey Jeffrey Epstein-
Cc: Emad Hanna ; William Rowles|

From: Gary Kerney

Sent: Mon 2/28/2011 8:00:51 PM

Subject: RE: flagpole
Jeffrey

Would you approve this budget in advance of finalizing it from plans so Emad can pay for current activity.we are
not commiting to any serious dollars at this time,mostly pool work

Gary

From: Gary Kerney

Sent: Fri 2/25/2011 12:59 PM
To: Jeffrey Epstein

Cc: Emad Hanna; William Rowles
Subject: FW: flagpole

Jeffrey

Do you have any budget comments?this is as close as we can estimate til the plans near compleation,and
eliminate the assumptions .

We are purchasing materials that are known for structures but Emad will not authorize payments til you approve
the budget.

Please advise

Gary

From: Gary Kerney

Sent: Thu 2/24/2011 4:10 PM
To: Jeffrey Epstein

Cc: Emad Hanna

Subject: flagpaole

Sorry here's the flagpole budget
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