
To: Lesley Gro 
From: Jeffrey Epsf ein 
Sent Fri 3/4/2011 5:37:25 PM 
Subject: Re: 

ok 

On Fri, Mar 4, 2011 at 9:35 AM, Lesley Groff wrote: 

nays awhile back you had said you would pay for the school she wanted to go to...she 
is asking if you can still help. The total is around $900 
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