
To: Richard hn 
Cc: Sarah K 
From: Jeffrey Epstein 
Sent: Tue 3/6/2012 6:02:45 PM 
Subject: Re: ion nicola invoice febr 1st to febr 20th, 2012 

yes„ but htis is ridculous„ it is for jcnns apt. 

On Tue, Mar 6, 2012 at 12:45 PM, Richard Kahn <O> wrote: 

attached is ion's invoice for I I days worked in February 2012 at $303 per day totaling 
S3,333.00 
Sarah has reviewed invoice for accuracy 
Do I have your permission to pay? 

Richard Kahn 
HBRK Associates Inc. 

301 East 66th Street, Suite 10F 
New York NY 10065 

tel 
fax 
cell 

Begin forwarded message: 

From: ion nicola <n> 
Date: March 4. 2012 10:43:18 PM EST 
To: <n >
Subject: RE: ion nicola invoice febr 1st to febr 20th, 2012 

hi rich, 
i've attached here the invoice for the month of february 2012 
i've worked febr 1st to febr 14th on 66th st (jen's apt) and febrl4th(half day) and febr 20(half 

day), so the total worked days are 11, that means $3,333.00 ($303/day) 
please let me know if got the invoice. 
thank you, 

ion nicola 

*********************************************************** 
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The information contained in this communication is 
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may 
constitute inside information, and is intended only for 
the use of the addressee. It is the property of 
Jeffrey Epstein 
Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this 
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited 
and may be unlawful. If you have received this 
communication in error, please notify us immediately by 
return c-mail or by e-mail to jccvacation@gmail.com and 
destroy this communication and all copies thereof, 
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved 
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