To:  brice gordon| [

From: Jeffrey Epstein
Sent: Tue 2/14/2012 3:23:53 PM
Subject: Re: V| Gunite

ok

On Tue, Feb 14, 2012 at 10:20 AM, brice gordon - wrote:

Jeftrey
V I Gunite are requesting 2nd payment of 15k

the following back charges will be applied to this check

287.72 (BOL 10125304 - shipping charges for pool filters, paid via Igala's credit card)
4410 (INV 54193135 - 6 days demurrage charges for pool filters at Tropical)
1,331.98 (SCP INV. AW105377 - pool filters)
740.46 (BOL 10267709 - shipping charges for pool plaster)
S 2,404.26

Can Rich release payment

Brice Gordon
Little Saint James
LISV

phone: [
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The information contained in this communication is
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may
constitute inside information, and is intended only for
the use of the addressee. It is the property of

Jeffrey Epstein

Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited
and may be unlawful. If you have received this
communication in error, please notify us immediately by
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation(@ gmail.com, and
destroy this communication and all copies thereof,
including all attachments. copyright -all nghts reserved
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