
To: Erika Kellerhals 
From: Jeffrey Epstein 
Sent Wed 2/22/2012 6:56:15 PM 
Subject: Re: RT Park 

pay it. 

On Wed, Feb 22, 2012 at 11:35 AM, Erika Kellerhals 

see below. Please let me know what you would like to do. 

 Forwarded messa e 
From: Hunt Logan 
Date: Wed, Feb 22, 2012 at 8:57 AM 
Subject: RE: RT Park 
To: Erika Kellerhals 
Cc: 

Hello Erika 

wrote: 

Normally the term sheet is signed first, but I guess that Mr. Epstein could pay the due diligence 
fees with the application submittal and we (Pete and Andersen and I) could begin the due 
diligence process. 

Hunt 

G. Hunter Logan, Jr., Esq. 

Nichols Newman Logan & Grey, P.C. 
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The information contained in this communication is 
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may 
constitute inside information, and is intended only for 
the use of the addressee. It is the property of 
Jeffrey Epstein 
Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this 
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited 
and may be unlawful. If you have received this 
communication in error, please notify us immediately by 
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation@gmail.com, and 
destroy this communication and all copies thereof, 
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved 
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